
PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

Anticipated Guaranteed Basic Info 

Base Price Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support GPS GPS Ant. Delivery Delivery on Warranties
NAME/ADDRESS Make/Year/Model Each Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace Antenna Cable/Coax Date Date Guarantees

Sonic Automotive 2012 bumper to bumper
18900 Northwest Frwy Chevrolet 19,574.96$            292.94$             Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 350.75$             Incl. w/ 153.00$             Incl. w/ 60-90 days 3 yr / 36K mile
Houston, TX 77065 Impala floor floor floor Display/ GPS power train

mount mount mount Keyboard Mt. Antenna 5 yr/ 100K mile

Southwest Ford 2012 Ford bumper to bumper
3000 Fort Worth Hwy Taurus 19,906.88$            N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Jan-12 Feb. 2012 3 yr / 36K mile
Weatherford, TX 76087 power train

5 yr/ 100K mile

Caldwell Country Chevrolet 2012 Chevrolet bumper to bumper
800 State Hwy 21 Impala 18,756.00$            88.00$               36.00$               60.00$               55.00$               180.00$             40.00$               30.00$               20.00$               90-120 days 120 days 3 yr / 36K mile
Caldwell, TX 77836 IWF19

Jerry's Chevrolet 2012 Chevrolet bumper to bumper
3118 Fort Worth Hwy Impala 18,613.96$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile
Weatherford, TX 76086 order order power train

5 yr/ 100K mile

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep 2012 Dodge bumper to bumper
2351 SE Loop 820 Charger 22,508.00$            125.00$             Incl. w/ 175.00$             Incl. w/ 310.00$             97.00$               160.00$             Incl. w/ 120 days 150 days 3 yr / 36K mile
Fort Worth, TX 76119 floor Display/Keybd GPS power train

mount 5 yr/ 100K mile

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet 2012 Chevrolet bumper to bumper
1009 Hwy. 82 West Impala 9C3 20,508.00$            89.00$               Incl. 46.00$               79.00$               309.00$             44.00$               41.00$               Incl. 80-120 Days 150 Days 3 yr / 36K mile
Whitesboro, TX 76273 power train

5 yr/ 100K mile

Reliable Chevrolet 2012 Chevrolet Steel Rim Spare bumper to bumper
800 North Central Expwy Impala Sedan LS Fleet 18,750.20$            88.00$               36.00$               60.00$               55.00$               180.00$             40.00$               30.00$               20.00$               64-79 days 100 days 3 yr / 36K mile
Richardson, TX 75080 IWF19 Alum Rim Spare power train

19,012.39$            5 yr/ 100K mile

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Optional Equipment
Bid Item 2: 1 New and Unused Non-Police Package Mid-Size Sedans
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Deviations Anticipated Guaranteed

from Base Price Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support GPS GPS Ant. Delivery Delivery
Specifications Make/Year/Model Each Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace Antenna Cable/Coax Date Date

Full Size Spare not available 2012
Chevrolet 26,163.90$         307.06$              Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 350.75$              Incl. w/ 153.93$              Incl. w/ 60-90 days
Caprice floor floor floor Display/ GPS 

mount mount mount Keyboard Mt. Antenna

4 Speed Auto Trans; 2013 Ford
AM/FM Single CD; Console Gear Sedan Police 23,816.88$         N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Mar-12 May 2012

Shift; Carpet Flooring: and Compact Interceptor
Steel Wheel Spare

6 or 8 port power supply $50 Chevrolet Caprice PPV
2011 or 2012 25,646.00$         88.00$                36.00$                60.00$                55.00$                180.00$              40.00$                30.00$                20.00$                90-120 days 120 days

IEW19 some in stock

Split bench seat - 40/20/40 2012 Chevrolet
CD Player Standard Caprice 25,135.40$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of w/in 6 wks of

order order

Dodge Police Pursuit with 2012 Dodge
Street Appearance Group Charger 23,631.00$         125.00$              Incl. w/ 175.00$              Incl. w/ 310.00$              97.00$                160.00$              Incl. w/ 120 days 150 days

floor Display/Keybd GPS
mount

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Detective version of Impala 2012 Chevrolet
Caprice 0C1 26,161.00$         89.00$                Incl. 46.00$                79.00$                309.00$              44.00$                41.00$                Incl. 90-150 days 150 days

Opt. Eq does not include installation 2012 Chevrolet
Caprice PPV 9C1 IEW19 25,789.40$         88.00$                36.00$                60.00$                55.00$                180.00$              40.00$                30.00$                20.00$                30-145 days 150 days

2011 Chevrolet 
Caprice PPV 9C1 25,466.00$         

NO BID 2012 Dodge
Price good thru 

04/11/2012

Charger Pursuit 22,699.00$         88.00$                36.00$                60.00$                88.00$                180.00$              40.00$                30.00$                20.00$                60-75 days 120 days

Price 04/12-
09/30/2012

24,328.00$         

Optional Equipment
Bid Item 2.2 New & unused full size sedan police pkg
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Basic Info Deviations Anticipated

on Warranties from Base Price Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support GPS GPS Ant. Delivery
Guarantees Specifications Make/Year/Model Each Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace Antenna Cable/Coax Date

bumper to bumper Chevrolet 1500
3 yr / 36K mile Silverado 23,708.70$               294.31$              Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 350.75$              Incl. w/ 153.93$           Incl. w/ 60-90 days

power train Crew Cab floor floor floor Display/ GPS 
5 yr/ 100K mile mount mount mount Keyboard Mt. Antenna

bumper to bumper V-6  Engine 2012 Ford 
3 yr / 36K mile Front Wheel Drive F150 24,138.88$               N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Dec-11

power train Steel Compact Wheel - Spare
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 6 or 8 port power supply $50 2012 Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile Silverado LT-Z71 23,440.00$               88.00$                36.00$                      60.00$                55.00$                 180.00$              40.00$                  30.00$             20.00$                60-75 days

Crew Cab w/skid plate
Alt. w/o Skid Plate - 1500 22,746.00$               

bumper to bumper 2012  Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile 1500 22,938.95$               No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of

power train order
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 2012 Dodge
3 yr / 36K mile Ram Truck 1500 20,560.00$               125.00$              Incl. w/ 175.00$              Incl. w/ 310.00$              97.00$                  160.00$           Incl. w/ 120 days

power train Crew Cab 4x2 floor Display/Keybd GPS
5 yr/ 100K mile mount

No Bid No Bid 2012 Dodge
Ram 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Quad Cab 27,239.00$               Nov. 2011
Crew Cab 28,741.00$               Nov. 2011

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile Silverado 22,728.00$               89.00$                Incl. 46.00$                79.00$                 309.00$              44.00$                  41.00$             Incl. 90-120 days

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Alt Bid: does not incl. the following 2012 Chevrolet Crew Cab
3 yr / 36K mile no comm. key, inoperable door handles, CC10543 24,307.01$               88.00$                36.00$                      60.00$                55.00$                 180.00$              40.00$                  30.00$             20.00$                64-79 days

power train rear windows & door locks; CC10543 w/LT pkg 24,307.01$               
5 yr/ 100K mile Immediate delivery CC10543 w/LT w/Z71 24,876.51$               

bumper to bumper Power Supply $50 2012 Dodge 1500 QC
 Good thru 

01/31/2012 $19,543 

3 yr / 36K mile Options: +$1,549 wiring harness
02/01-09/30/2012   

$20,333 88.00$                36.00$                      60.00$                55.00$                 180.00$              40.00$                  30.00$             20.00$                45-60 days

power train 2012 Dodge 1500 CC
 Good thru 

01/31/2012 $20,153 

5 yr/ 100K mile
02/01-04/12/2012   

$20,355 
04/13- End Model 

Yr.   $20,688 

Optional Equipment
Bid Item 2.3 New & unused 1/2 ton Quad Cab Patrol Pick Up Trucks Non Police Pkg
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Guaranteed Basic Info Deviations Anticipated

Delivery on Warranties from 3/4 Ton Veh Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support GPS GPS Ant. Delivery
Date Guarantees Specifications Make/Year/Model Base Price Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace Antenna Cable/Coax Date

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile 2500 Silverado 24,104.85$                    294.31$            Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 350.75$            Incl. w/ 153.94$        Incl. w/ 60-90 days

power train Crew Cab floor floor floor Display/ GPS 
5 yr/ 100K mile mount mount mount Keyboard Mt. Antenna

bumper to bumper 4 Spd Trans 2012 Ford
Feb -12 3 yr / 36K mile 5.0L Eng; 3.55 Elec. F250 22,994.82$                    N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Dec-11

power train Locking; No Skid Plate
5 yr/ 100K mile Vinyl Seating: CD

bumper to bumper 6 or 8 port power supply $50 2012 Chevrolet Silverado
90-120 days 3 yr / 36K mile 2500 4x2 Crew Cab 22,440.00$                    88.00$              36.00$                60.00$           55.00$              180.00$            40.00$              30.00$          20.00$                60-90 days

SWB - CC20743 Alt. LT - w/Skid Plate
No Skid Plate 25,776.00$                    

bumper to bumper 6 Speed Transmission 2012 Chevrolet
w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile 3.42 Rear Axle 2500 23,058.85$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of

order power train order
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Seats must be all cloth or 2012 Dodge
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile all vinyl; no skid plate; Ram Truck 2500 19,566.00$                    125.00$            Incl. w/ 175.00$         Incl. w/ 310.00$            97.00$              160.00$        Incl. w/ 120 days

power train P265/70R17 BSW All Crew Cab 4x2 floor Display/Keybd GPS
5 yr/ 100K mile Season Tires mount

bumper to bumper 2012 Dodge
3 yr / 36K mile Ram 2500 29,300.00$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nov. 2011

Nov. 2011 power train
Nov. 2011 5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper No Dual Battery Option 2012 Chevrolet
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile Front Disc Rear Drum Brakes Silverado 22,157.00$                    89.00$              Incl. 46.00$           79.00$              309.00$            44.00$              41.00$          Incl. 90-120 days

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Disc Brakes only on front; 3.73 2012 Chevrolet 
100 days 3 yr / 36K mile n/a; Spare Wheel doesn't match; CC20743 Crew Cab 23,699.85$                    88.00$              36.00$                60.00$           55.00$              180.00$            40.00$              30.00$          20.00$                74-89 days

power train All cloth or all vinyl; skid plate SWB; incl. aux. battery &
5 yr/ 100K mile only avail. On LT trim optional alternator

bumper to bumper Power Supply $50 2012 Dodge Ram 
Price good thru 

01/31/2012

90 days 3 yr / 36K mile Vinyl Floor 2500 Crew Cab 19,913.00$                    88.00$              36.00$                60.00$           55.00$              180.00$            40.00$              30.00$          20.00$                50-60 days

power train Price 02/01-04/12/2012

5 yr/ 100K mile 20,409.00$                    

21,009.00$                    

Optional Equipment
Bid Item 2.4  3/4 ton Quad Cab P/U Non-Police Pkg
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Guaranteed Basic Info Deviations Anticipated

Delivery on Warranties from 1/2 Ton  Veh Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support GPS GPS Ant. Delivery
Date Guarantees Specifications Make/Year/Model Base Price Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace Antenna Cable/Coax Date

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe 28,450.00$         294.31$              Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 350.75$              Incl. w/ 153.93$              Incl. w/ 60-90 days

power train floor floor floor Display/ GPS 
5 yr/ 100K mile mount mount mount Keyboard Mt. Antenna

bumper to bumper 6 Spd. Trans; 2012 Ford
Jan-12 3 yr / 36K mile 6.2L V8 Engine; Expedition 27,850.35$         N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Dec-11

power train No Skid Plate: CD
5 yr/ 100K mile No Rear Defrost

bumper to bumper 6 or 8 port power supply $50 2012 Chevrolet
90-120 days 3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe 1 FL CC10706 27,680.00$         88.00$                36.00$                60.00$                55.00$                180.00$              40.00$                30.00$                20.00$                60-90 days

No Skid Plate
Alt. PPV w/Skid Plate 24,744.00$         

bumper to bumper 6.0L Engine 2012 Chevrolet
w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile 6 Speed Transmission Tahoe 28,485.25$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of

order power train order
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Seats must be all cloth or 2012 Dodge
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile all vinyl; no skid plate; Durango 30,528.00$         125.00$              Incl. w/ 175.00$              Incl. w/ 310.00$              97.00$                160.00$              Incl. w/ 120 days

power train floor Display/Keybd GPS
5 yr/ 100K mile mount

bumper to bumper 2012 Dodge
Nov. 2011 3 yr / 36K mile Durango 32,058.00$         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nov. 2012

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe IFL 27,732.00$         89.00$                Incl. 46.00$                79.00$                309.00$              44.00$                41.00$                Incl. 90-120 days

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Interior all cloth or all vinyl Chevrolet Tahoe
105 days 3 yr / 36K mile Rear defogger n/a on CC10706 1500 28,699.95$         88.00$                36.00$                60.00$                55.00$                180.00$              40.00$                30.00$                20.00$                65-84 days

power train WT Model Commercial
5 yr/ 100K mile Non-Police Pkg.

bumper to bumper Power Supply $50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

90 days 3 yr / 36K mile

power train

5 yr/ 100K mile

Optional Equipment
Bid Item 2.5 New and unused Full Size 4 door SUV Non-Police Pkg
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Guaranteed Basic Info Deviations

Delivery on Warranties from Option 1 Option 2: Base + Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd
Date Guarantees Specifications Make/Year/Model Base Price Base + Eq & Install Opt 1 + DVD + Install Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe PPV 26,022.75$        31,326.53$             31,772.75$                  272.81$             Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 329.25$                 

power train floor floor floor
5 yr/ 100K mile mount mount mount

bumper to bumper Limited Slip N/A; CD Player: 2013 Ford
Jan-12 3 yr / 36K mile No Under Carriage Skid Plate; Utility Police 28,961.88$        N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

power train No Hvy Duty Batt; No Hvy Duty Interceptr
5 yr/ 100K mile Alternator; No Hvy Duty Radiator

bumper to bumper 6 or 8 port power supply $50 2012 Chevrolet
90-120 days 3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe PPV 25,140.00$        30,887.00$             35,129.00$                  88.00$               36.00$                         60.00$               55.00$               180.00$                 

bumper to bumper 3.08 Rear Axle 2012 Chevrolet 
w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile 40/20/40 Front Bench Seat Tahoe 25,387.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

order power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Floor console gear shift; cloth seats
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile only; carpet flooring; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

power train No Skid Plate
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper
Nov. 2012 3 yr / 36K mile No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 2012 Chevrolet
150 days 3 yr / 36K mile Tahoe PPV 25,704.00$        31,536.28$             36,981.28$                  89.00$               Incl. 46.00$               79.00$               309.00$                 

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Incl. requested upgrade HD battery 2012 Chevrolet
100 days 3 yr / 36K mile Interior will be all vinyl or all cloth. CC10706 PPV 25,457.38$        31,140.38$             35,335.38$                  88.00$               36.00$                         60.00$               55.00$               180.00$                 

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item 2.6 Full Size 4 Door 1/2 ton SUV Police Pkg - 2 WD
Optional Equipment
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Anticipated Guaranteed Basic Info Deviations

Support 6 or 8 port GPS GPS Ant. Delivery Delivery on Warranties from
Bracket/Brace power supply Antenna Cable/Coax Date Date Guarantees Specifications

bumper to bumper
Incl. w/ 117.50$           132.43$                Incl. w/ 60-90 days 3 yr / 36K mile
Display/ GPS power train

Keyboard Mt. Antenna 5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 3.7L V-6 Engine;
N/A N/A N/A N/A Apr-12 June-12 3 yr / 36K mile 3.39 Front Wheel Drive

power train Single CD Player
5 yr/ 100K mile No Running Boards

bumper to bumper
40.00$                  50.00$                    30.00$                  20.00$               60-90 days 90-120 days 3 yr / 36K mile

bumper to bumper
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile

order order power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

bumper to bumper
44.00$                  120.00$                  41.00$                  Incl. 60-90 Days 120 days 3 yr / 36K mile

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper No top handles will be added
40.00$                  50.00$                    30.00$                  20.00$               95-105 days 120 days 3 yr / 36K mile

4-5 weeks for upfit power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item 2.6 (Cont.)
Optional Equipment
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Option 1 Option 2: Base + Floor Raised Floor Lower Swivel Display/Keybd Support
Make/Year/Model Base Price Base + Eq & Install Opt 1 + DVD + Install Mount Mount Bracket Pole Mount Mount Bracket/Brace

2012 Chevrolet 
Tahoe 4 WD 29,314.65$                  34,618.43$                   35,064.65$                     272.81$                          Incl. w/ Incl. w/ Incl. w/ 329.25$                          Incl. w/

floor floor floor Display/
mount mount mount Keyboard Mt.

2013 Ford 
SUV Police Interceptor 27,916.88$                  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

2012 Chevrolet
Tahoe 4x4 SSV 28,337.00$                  33,976.00$                   38,193.00$                     88.00$                            36.00$                        60.00$                            55.00$                            180.00$                          40.00$                            

2012 Chevrolet Tahoe
28,678.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet
Tahoe SSV 28,726.00$                  34,549.28$                   39,994.28$                     89.00$                            Incl. 46.00$                            79.00$                            309.00$                          44.00$                            

2012 Chevrolet 
CK10706 5W4 28,211.78$                  33,894.78$                   38,089.78$                     88.00$                            36.00$                        60.00$                            55.00$                            180.00$                          40.00$                            

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Item 2.7 New and unused Full Size 4 Door 1/2 ton SUV Police Pkg - 4 WD
Optional Equipment
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PC12-01 Law Enforcement Fleet Vehicles
 October 12, 2011

NAME/ADDRESS
Sonic Automotive
18900 Northwest Frwy
Houston, TX 77065

Southwest Ford
3000 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76087

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 State Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Jerry's Chevrolet
3118 Fort Worth Hwy
Weatherford, TX 76086

Meador Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
2351 SE Loop 820
Fort Worth, TX 76119

Roger Williams Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep
1015 Fort Worth Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76086

Holiday Chevrolet
1009 Hwy. 82 West
Whitesboro, TX 76273

Reliable Chevrolet
800 North Central Expwy
Richardson, TX 75080

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

2601 William D. Tate Ave.

Grapevine, TX 76051

Prohibited to accept bid under

A.G. Opinion MW-299

Anticipated Guaranteed Basic Info Deviations Willing to

6 or 8 port GPS GPS Ant. Delivery Delivery on Warranties from Piggyback 
power supply Antenna Cable/Coax Date Date Guarantees Specifications Contract

bumper to bumper 3.08 Axle deleted w/PPV: Axle = 3.42
117.50$                 132.43$                          Incl. w/ 60-90 days 3 yr / 36K mile PPV is not a pursuit related vehicle

GPS power train
Antenna 5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper 3.7L V-6 Engine
N/A N/A N/A Apr-12 June-12 3 yr / 36K mile 3.39 Rear Axle W/O Rear Locking Differential

power train Single CD Player
5 yr/ 100K mile No Running Boards

bumper to bumper
50.00$                            30.00$                            20.00$                            60-90 days 90-120 days 3 yr / 36K mile

bumper to bumper 3.42 Axle
No Bid No Bid No Bid w/in 6 wks of w/in 6 wks of 3 yr / 36K mile

order order power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

bumper to bumper
120.00$                          41.00$                            Incl. 60-90 Days 120 days 3 yr / 36K mile

power train
5 yr/ 100K mile

bumper to bumper Rear Axle 3.42; front seat 40/20/40;
50.00$                            30.00$                            20.00$                            95-105 days 120 days 3 yr / 36K mile no top grab handles; skid plates only available

power train if On/Off Road Suspension option is chosen.
5 yr/ 100K mile

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

YES

YES

YES

NO

YES

YES

Optional Equipment

YES

No

YES

Bid Item 2.7 (Cont.)

Page 9


