BID # RFP PC08-40

ITEM: UNIFORMS

DATE : JANUARY 30, 2008

DEPARTMENT COUNTYWIDE

Work Shirts Dress Shirts Trousers Dress Pants Jean Pants Coveralls Jackets Work Shirts
65/35 Dacron 65/35 Poly/Cotton twill Blue Denim Cotton/Poly Cotton/Poly 100% Cotton Twill
NAME/ADDRESS Unit pr Week Unit pr Week Unit pr Week Unit pr Week Unit pr Week Wrangler Jeans Unit pr Week Unit pr Week unit pr Week
Aramark Uniform Services 1.75 2.70 2.20 260 % 3.40 $8.75/wk. $ 0.80 | $ 0441 % 2.60
205 E. MorningSide WearGuard Jeans No return available 100% Cotton
Fort Worth, TX 76104 Full Price for 1st Blue Denim
24 mos. 2% deprc. Shirts avail.
each month after
Replacement Costs 13.00 14.00 23.00 23.00 [ $ 14.00 36.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 28.00| % 23.00
Unifirst Corporation 3.48 4.37 4.70 507 | $ 4.59 $6.64/wk. $ 850 | % 1.10 | $ 452
2900 N. Beach Street Unifirst Jeans No return available 2 Jackets 100% Cotton
Fort Worth, TX 76117 Blue Denim
Replacement Costs: Shirts avail.
0-6 mo. $18/pr. $3.04-$3.98/wk
7-12 mo. $14/pr. cost varies by shirt
Replacement Costs 8.71 10.92 11.75 13.85| $ 12.55 12+ mos. $12/pr. $ 2320 [ $ 2362 | $ 11.31
G&K Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

603 Airline Drive

Coppell, TX 75019

Replacement Costs




BID # PC08-40

ITEM: UNIFORMS

DATE : 01/30/08 DEPARTMENT COUNTYWIDE

Trousers 18" x 18" Mop Heads 4x6 3x4 Manufacturer Misc.
Cotton Twill 30 Shop Towels 4 Dry Mops Syn. Mat Syn. Mat Delivery Time Brand Quoted
NAME/ADDRESS Unit pr Week Unit pr Week 3 Wet Mops Unit pr Week Unit pr Week Starching From Measurement

Aramark Uniform Services $ 3.80 | $1.50/30 towels Dry Mop - $0.40/4 mops | $ 296 | $ 1.48 No charge Implementation Wear Guard No depreciation

205 E. MorningSide $0.05/each Wet Mop - $0.30/3 mops time frame unless item is

Fort Worth, TX 76104 3-4 weeks lost or unusable
regular sizes Full replacement
6-8 weeks cost first 24 mos.
large special 2% depreciation

Replacement Costs $ 27.00 order sizes thereafter

Unifirst Corporation $ 5.71 $0.08/each Dry Mop - $1.00/each [ $ 325| % 2.25 $1.10/pant Implementation Unifirst Replacement Costs

2900 N. Beach Street Wet Mop - $1.50/each $0.65/shirt time frame are bottom

Fort Worth, TX 76117 Heavy Starch Only 4-6 weeks cost for lost or

unusable items
Replacement Costs $ 14.28
G&K Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid G&K Services

603 Airline Drive

is a Buyboard

Coppell, TX 75019

Vendor

Replacement Costs




